
  Church Family 

Wed 
23 

The Bereavement Group, meeting 
today. For all those who have been 
bereaved recently. 

Perpetual Asor 
and Mikel  

SM 

Thu 
24 

Children and young people in Care, 
especially those who may be facing a 
time of further change in their home 
or school lives. 

Eric Atkinson 
SM 

Fri 
25 

The York Road Project for the 
Homeless. All who have no settled 
place to live and those who help them. 

Jacqui Avenell 
SP 

Sat 
26 

For safety for all those travelling by 
land, sea and air, and especially for 
those going on holiday. 

Mary Baker 
AS 

Sun 
27 

St Peter’s bell ringers. For those who 
hear the bells to be reminded of God’s 
presence. 

Janet Barrett 
Mark Barrett 

SM 

Mon 
28 

The Ministry Team, meeting today, as 
they endeavour to continue to provide 
for our spiritual needs. 

Peter Bliss 
SM 

Tue 
29 

Those who are leaving school, college 
or University. That their next steps 
will become clear to them. 

Marie Blomfield, 
Charlie, Riley and 

Evie    SP 

Wed 
30 

All those who care for others, that 
they are able to set aside some time 
each day for themselves.  

Rosemary Booth 
SP 

Thu 
31 

Our Parish Administrator, Caroline 
Harvey. 

Gemma and  
Adam Bourne and 

Archie  SP 
 
Morning Prayer 
  All days are on Zoom except Thursdays when we usually meet in 
person at St Peter’s Church. 
  To join Morning Prayer on Zoom enter Meeting ID: 498 905 544 
Passcode: 668876 
 

Midweek Communion – Thursday 24 July – 10.30am 
  Join us for a quiet said Communion service followed by tea and 
cake in the vestry.  (NB There is no Morning Prayer that day) 
 

 

 
 

 

PARISH PRAYER DIARY 
July 2025 

 
 

As we rejoice in the gift of each new day, 

so may the light of your presence, O God, 

set our hearts on fire with love for you; 

now and for ever.    Amen 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
  



  Church Family 

Tue 
1 

For all the peoples of Israel, Gaza, 
Palestine and Iran, that the fragile 
ceasefire will continue to hold. 

Marion Taylor 
SP 

Wed 
2 

Pray for our new projects at St Mark’s 
- the Community Garden and the  
Community Fridge. That they will 
become widely known and supported. 

John Telfer 
SP 

Thu 
3 

That all those attending the Harry 
Baker Concert today will be aware of 
God’s presence with them. 

Sarah and 
Jonathan Thomas 
Tabitha & Aidan 

Fri 
4 

Connections Café, meeting today. 
That those who come will enjoy a 
time of fellowship, food, and crafting.  

Janet and 
Terry Tigwell   

SP 

Sat 
5 

Jacquie Still, as she participates in the 
Lay Ministry Celebration at Guildford 
Cathedral at the end of her course. 

Rosemary 
Titcombe  SP 

Sun 
6 

Our pastoral assistants, Brenda Cox, 
Allison McFarlane, Carol Whitehorn 
and Pauline Wilde, as they keep in 
touch with parishioners, especially 
those living alone. 

Joanna and  
Jason Tutty, 

Daisy, Josie and 
Grace AS 

Mon 
7 

On the 20th anniversary of the London 
bombings, pray for all those affected 
by acts of terrorism. 

Pamela Upcott 
SM 

Tue 
8 

Environment Team, meeting today 
with, hopefully, a new member from 
St Peter’s joining the group. 

Margaret Walker 
Isobel Walker    

AS 

Wed 
9 

Those who provide music for our 
services, including Trevor, Rosemary, 
Inspiration and the Band. 

Valerie and 
Ken Walker    

SP 

Thu 
10 

The candidates, from all parties, 
standing in County Council and 
Borough Council elections in South 
Woking today and for everyone to use 
their votes. 

Grahame Wall 
SP 

Fri 
11 

The General Synod, meeting in York 
from today. Join with them in prayer 
as they seek to appoint the next 
Archbishop of Canterbury. 

Bernadette and 
Martin Whipp 

SP 

  Church Family 

Sat 
12 

Hoe Bridge School - its students, 
staff, governors and parents.   

Robin Whitcomb 
SP 

Sun 
13 

Councillor Amanda Boote, Mayor of 
Woking and her mayoral charity for 
2025-6, the Citizens Advice Bureau. 

Carol and 
Brian Whitehorn 

SP 

Mon 
14 

For the daily Morning Prayer services, 
that they will continue to provide a 
focus for prayer and Bible study. 

Pauline and 
David Wilde 

SP 

Tue 
15 

Tots, our toddlers’ and carers’ group 
and ‘Refresh’ and ‘Refresh Extra’, 
our after-school clubs, all meeting at 
St Mark’s today. 

Mary and 
Geoff Williams 

SP 

Wed 
16 

For the Prime Minister and those who 
are guiding our nation at this time, 
and shaping national policies, that 
they may make wise decisions. 

Pam and  
John Withrington 

SP 

Thu 
17 

Those who care for the sick.  
Chaplains, doctors and nurses, 
paramedics and other staff and 
volunteers. 

Maria and Julian 
Withrington 

Alexander and 
Nicholas     SP 

Fri 
18 

The leaders and members of Craft and 
Chat, meeting for the last time today 
until resuming in September.  

Christine and 
Christian Wolters 

SP 

Sat 
19 

Marriage of Jonathan Browning and 
Rebekah Austin-Sparkes at St Peter’s 
today. That they will welcome God 
into their home and marriage. 

Trevor Aldridge 
Valerie Aldridge 

SP 

Sun 
20 

The residents and staff of Kingsleigh.  
All those with dementia and those 
who care for them. 

Kirsty Angus 
and Mary   SP 

Mon 
21 

Jonathan and Sarah, Lucy and Dave, 
that their holidays will provide a time 
for rest and relaxation – with good 
weather! 

Robert Angus 
SP 

Tue 
22 

Schools break up this week. That 
staff, pupils and their families will be 
able to enjoy a time of rest and 
relaxation together. 

Wendy Aplin 
SP 

 


